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During the post-war period transna­
tional mining companies began to 
switch more and more of their attention 
to the Third World. High-quality ores 
and low labour costs created precondi­
tions for low production costs and high 
profits. The objectives of the mining 
companies soon conflicted with the ex­
pectations of host countries regarding 
potential development effects from in­
vestments in the exploitation of their 
mineral resources. In order to increase 
their return from the activities of the 
companies host countries have adopted 
different tactics. The most important of 
these have been: 

• Nationalization of the assets of the
companies.
• Substantially tougher tax regimes and
a range of demands on the companies
for impoving their socio-economic con­
tributions.
• Joint ventures between host govern­
ments and foreign mining companies.
• The formation of producer associa­
tion.

Producer associations 

This alternative has proved to constitute 
the least serious threat to the com­
panies. A succesful association must 
control a raw material with no close 
substitutes, and supplies outside the 
association should be scarce. It is an ad­
vantage if there are only a handful of 
countries controlling production and 
reserves. These countries furthermore 
should be politically compatible, with 
common interests. This last precondi­
tion for a succesful association is also 
the crucial one and, as it has turned out, 
the weakest link in the chain. The pro­
ducer associations have often failed to 
adopt a common pricing policy or 
adopted a policy which has affected the 
final customers rather than the com­
panies themselves. 

Nationalizations 

This first alternative has been fairly 
limited in its application (between 1956 

and 1972 foreign mining companies had 
around 20 per cent of their foreign 
assets nationalized). Furthermore, they 
were usually generously compensated 
and given the management responsi­
bility. 

Joint venture 

This could be seen as a development of 
the nationalization strategy. It provides 
a means for governmental control over 
operations through joint stockholding. 
The joint venture concept may be less 
effective than anticipated from the 
point of view of increasing host country 
returns from an operation. The major 
reason would be the role of the govern­
ment as an owner of the company. This 
may sometimes give rise to conflicts of 
interest, since what is good for the com­
pany may not always be good for the na­
tional economy. Needless to say this 
situation may impose certain restric­
tions on the formulation of effective 
mining policies. 

Increased taxation 

This alternative has turned out to be the 
most viable one from the point of view 
of maximizing the developmental im­
pact a mining operation may have on the 
host economy. It is this option which 
will be analysed here. 

What is a mineral economy? 

How do we recognize a mineral econo­
my when we see one? This may at first 
sight seem to be fairly simple, but cer­
tain definitional issues nevertheless 
need to be clarified. A mineral economy 
is a developing economy, highly depend­
ent on the extraction of one or two 
minerals for its survival. Qualifying 
criteria for such dependence may be the 
share of mineral production in total 
GDP (at least 15 per cent), the share of 
total export earnings (at least 40 per 
cent). These are economic criteria. But 
dependence also has a political dimen-
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