


First the oil producing countries 
started. building huge refinery com­
plexes. Not surprisingly, they started 
from a relatively small base and growth 
figures were rather impressive: installed 
refining capacity in the Middle East 
rose from 2.270 million barrels/day (4.4 
per cent of world capacity) in 1970 to 
more than 4 million barrels/day (5.3 per
cent) in 1989.3 

Expansion figures are now flattening 
out, though, due to an increased aware­
ness of global overcapacity and sharply 
reduced oil export revenues. Impressive 
as these growth figures may be, there 
still is a wide discrepancy between 
these oil producing countries' share of 
refining operations and its still far big­
ger share of world crude oil production: 
5.3 per cent vs. 26.3 percent (1989). 
Compared to the region's share of 
global oil and gas reserves (more than 
65 per cent)' the margin of course is 
even much larger. 

Refinery expansion took place 
mainly in Saudi Arabia and Kuwait. As 
the Saudis showed a preference for 
joint-ventures with multinationals, the 
Kuwaitis refrained from this and fol­
lowed a strategy of self-reliance. An­
other difference in strategy is Kuwait's 
growin� emphasis on petroleum product
exports , compared to Saudi Arabia's 
continued commitment to exporting 
crude. Both countries have managed to 
become nearly self-sufficient as far as 
the demands of the domestic market are 
concerned. 

Besides erecting its own inland refin­
eries, Kuwait (recently followed by Abu 
Dhabi and Saudi Arabia) showed an 
emphatic appetite for refinery com­
plexes overseas. Here again, the more 
conservative oriented Saudis are follow­
ing the more traditional avenue of co­
operation with oil multinationals (ie 
Texaco), while Kuwait is entering di­
rectly and purchasing or develotng 
downstream operations on its own. 

Second, millions of dollars were in­
vested in petrochemical industry, most-

Raw Materials Report Vol 7 No 3 

ly within the region itself. Huge basic 
petrochemical plants have come on­
stream in the early 1980s, although 
many projects that were under consider­
ation at the end of last decade have 
been shelved as a result of declining oil 
revenues. By far, Saudi Arabia is the 
biggest investor in this field, putting u�
a remarkably sparkling performance. 
On the whole, however, one is struck 
again by the wide discrepancy between 
the regions huge oil and gas reserves 
and its modest share in global petro­
chemical production. 

Third a number of other industries 
were built, less directly related to lo­
cally available oil and gas reserves. 
Large aluminium smelter plants were 
erected in Bahrain and Dubai, steel
plants in Saudi Arabia and Bahrain, and 
shipbuilding and repair yards were set 
up in Bahrain and Dubai. The respec­
tive shares of these industries in world 
capacity are (and will stay) negligible. 

Constraints 

Apparently, some industries are starting 
to pay off handsomely. 

For instance, Saudi Basic Industries

Corporation (SABIC), responsible for 
the petrochemical sector) seems "almost 
irrepressibly cheerful about the future"8 
and a recent analysis by Petroleum In­
telligence Weekly concludes that the 
big Mideast export refineries are per­
forming quite well.9 

However, these incidental rejoicing 
notes sharply contrast with more frugal 
assessments, some of which have a 
bearing on 'technical' economic prob­
lems, while others touch upon more 
wide-ranging aspects of the develop­
ment process as such. 

• The first problem to be mentioned is
the conspicuous lack of regional coordi­

nation. Although shocking duplications
that were mostly common during the
1970s (eg seven international airports
and two sets of ship repair facilities

within a hundred mile range) tend to be 
evaded nowadays, the existing coordi­
nation is mainly politically inspired, by 
the Gulf Cooperation Council (GCC, 
founded in 1981), much less economi­
cally Organisation for Industrial Con­
sulting, (GOIC, established in 1976). 
Nationalistic and, although less than be­
fore, megalomaniac ambitions continue 
to dominate, leading to the highly unde­
sirable situation of competing industries 
in an already oversupplied market.10 

• A second note to be made concerns
the cost structure of the industrial plants
which have been built. Several factors
tend to offset the advantage of low vari­
able costs for feedstocks and fuel: high
investment costs (lack of infrastructure
and logistic support pushes up the ini­
tial investment costs in the Middle East
by between 1.5 and 1.8 times the level
in a developed country), operating costs
and marketing costs.11 

The end result is that Middle Eastern 
petrochemical production costs are not 
lower, and are often higher, than those 
in Europe, Japan or North America. 

Experts  seriously disagree on 
whether these export plants will be able 
to compete with established producers. 
Only when investors are prepared to ac­
cept a return on fixed capital which is 
lower than normally required at non-tra­
ditional locations, will these industries 
in the Gulf countries have a chance of 
being competitive.12 

Besides, as a result of depressed oil 
prices, refiners and petrochemical pro­
ducers in the industrialised world profit 
from a nice combination of cheaper raw 
materials with buoyant demand for 
products. Thereby, the competitive 
feedstock advantage of Gulf producers 
is gradually being eroded. 

• Under the label of (problems with)
market access, a third set of problems
should be dealt with.13 Among these,
two are prominent: continuing over­
capacity in the international market,
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